
8 Marsala Court, Greenville, 29609, SC

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/8-marsala-court/greenville/sc/29609/MLS_ID_1553944

Price - $3,849,000

Bedrooms

5

 

Baths

5

 

Half Baths

1

 

SqFt

5799

 

Lot Size

1.8100

 

DOM

94 Days

Features

Cooling

Central Air
 

Heating

Baseboard
 

Floors

Carpet

Roof

Architectural
 

Laundry Features

1st Floor
 

Appliances

Cooktop
Gas Water Heater



Community Features

Common Areas
 

Interior Features

2nd Stair Case
 

Fireplace Features

Ventless

Lot Features

1 - 2 Acres
Cul-De-Sac

 

Style

European
 

Other

By-Laws



Description

Experience unparalleled luxury just 10 minutes from downtown Greenville!! Nestled in Greenville’s
premier gated community, Montebello, this European - inspired mountain estate is set against the
western slopes of the Piney mountain in a 1.8 acre lot, one of the largest in the subdivision. This
gorgeous home is designed and built by Milestone Custom Builders, Greenville’s premier custom
home builder with over 25 years’ experience, for those who value elegance, comfort and
functionality. This exquisite homesite compliments Montebello’s natural beauty, with a classic and
eclectic home feature exteriors of brick, stone and real stucco. Enter through the front porch with
flagstone floor and begin exploring the main level’s incredible craftsmanship and its masterfully
arranged layout. An open concept plan with 12 ft. ceiling throughout the main level, resorts style
living room with coffered ceiling and floor to ceiling windows flood the home with natural light. The
expansive great room features an electric fireplace surrounded by gorgeous stone on three sides
that soars all the way to the ceiling and wide plank flooring. Just off the foyer and conveniently
located near the kitchen and great room, the large circular formal dining room features a coffered
ceiling and a gorgeous light fixture.The gourmet chef kitchen boasts top of the line wolf range,
bespoke cabinetry, and oversized quartz island, perfect for entertaining. The covered porch is
perfectly located to enjoy over the private back yard and features wooden ceiling and safety net
with railing and a double door to the backyard. On the opposite side of the house from the kitchen
are the downstairs master bedroom unit and a study with natural light and mountain views.
Rounding out the main level is the laundry room with Iron-a-way built-in wall table, the powder
room, and the attached 3 car garage with epoxy flooring. On the second level the upstairs master
suite with spa-like bath is gorgeous with frameless shower glass, beautiful large teardrop vanity
mirror, large overhead shower and beautiful vintage tile walls. There is a large library and lounge
area with built-in shelves, two bedrooms with attached bathrooms ensuring plenty of privacy and
breathtaking views of the blue ridge mountains from each room. There is also a walk-in attic area
on the second level for any storage needs. The basement level offers many options and is finished
to the same standard as the second level with 10 ft. ceilings. There is a gym room with full-size wall
mirrors and a game room with specialized rubber flooring. There is also a full size media room with
built in projector and a large home theater screen. This level also has a bedroom with excellent
views and a full bath. The gym room has backyard access through double doors to the natural trail
behind the landscaped area of the property. There is also plenty of unfinished area for storage or a
private wine cellar. The basement area would make a great mother-in-law suite, a private home
office, an older child’s living quarters, home gym, artist studio…the possibilities are endless. The
house has spray foam insulation to decrease energy consumption, modern gutter downspouts and
separate air conditioning units for each level. The professional crafted boulder stone landscaping
with the lush gardens create an unbelievable serene outdoor retreat with a scenic drive and a
separate parking pad in front of the house. This modern masterpiece showcases clean lines,
soaring ceilings and a seamless blend of indoor and outdoor living designed to impress even the
most sophisticated tastes. Homeowners share a variety of natural amenities including Club Bella,
six parks, ponds, Lake Como, Olympic swimming and toddler pools with a bath house, lighted
tennis and pickle-ball courts, putting green, playground and sixty areas of green ways and twelve
miles of private streets and walkways. This is an unbelievable opportunity to own this one of a kind
estate!
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Location



8 Marsala Court, Greenville, 29609, SC


