
710 Skyland, Columbia, 29210, SC

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/710-skyland/columbia/sc/29210/MLS_ID_605143

Price - $289,990

Bedrooms

3

 

Baths

2

 

SqFt

1734

 

Lot Size

0.4200

 

Year Built

1958

 

DOM

31 Days

Features

Cooling

Central
 

Foundation

Crawl Space
 

Style

Ranch
Traditional

Water

Public



Description

Welcome to 710 Skyland Drive. This beautifully remodeled 3 bedroom, 2 bathroom home is like
new from top to bottom and sits on a large half acre private lot in the highly desirable and
established Midlands community of Skyland Estates. The home’s pristine condition is immediately
apparent as you approach and view the new roof, new vinyl windows, and new HVAC unit. From
the moment you enter through the custom entryway you find a spacious main living area that
serves as a good preview for the rest of the home as it features modern daylight LED high
efficiency lighting, new flooring and fresh paint from ceiling to floor. An attractive and inviting
fireplace serves as an excellent focal point for the main living area and stirs up dreams of gathering
around to warm up with loved ones on cold winter nights. From the living room, make your way into
the designer kitchen that has been thoughtfully laid out with granite countertops, upgraded white
shaker cabinets, and new stainless-steel appliances. Just a short walk down the hall you will find
the three bedrooms on the main level as well as a beautifully updated bathroom. This home also
features a completely finished basement that provides a quiet place to relax with another beautiful
custom fireplace. Another full bath is located in the basement along with the laundry room. When
you’re not relaxing in your freshly renovated home, step outside into your cozy patio overlooking
the large private fenced yard. Last but certainly not least, the home is complete with a 420 sq ft
completely updated workshop with a large roll up 8x7 door for all of your storage needs and
ongoing projects. This home has convenient access to Interstate 26, 20, Downtown Columbia &
Lexington, Hospitals, and USC. Come ready to live, work and play here in this move-in ready
desirable home that will not last long. Disclaimer: CMLS has not reviewed and, therefore, does not
endorse vendors who may appear in listings.



SEE THIS PROPERTY

James Schiller

Realtor, Brand Name Real Estate

Phone: 18434788061

Email: jameseschiller@gmail.com

Check On Site

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/710-skyland/columbia/sc/29210/MLS_ID_605143

Location



710 Skyland, Columbia, 29210, SC


