
7 Cardinal Point, Salem, 29676, SC

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/7-cardinal-point/salem/sc/29676/MLS_ID_1554579

Price - $950,000

Bedrooms

4

 

Baths

3

 

SqFt

3023

 

Lot Size

0.2000

 

Year Built

2023

 

DOM

117 Days

Features

Cooling

Central Air
 

Heating

Electric
 

Floors

Ceramic Tile
Wood

Roof

Architectural
 

Laundry Features

Sink
1st Floor



Walk-in
Stackable
Accommodating
Laundry Room

 

Security Features

Smoke Detector(s)
 

Appliances

Dishwasher
Disposal
Free-Standing Gas
Range
Microwave
Electric Water HeaterCommunity Features

Clubhouse
Common Areas
Fitness Center
Gated
Golf
Street Lights
Recreational Path
Playground
Pool
Security Guard
Tennis Court(s)
Water Access
Dock
Boat Ramp
Dog Park
Neighborhood
Lake/Pond
Walking Trails
Community Center
Marina
Water Front Parks

 

Interior Features

High Ceilings
Ceiling Fan(s)
Granite Counters
Open Floorplan
Walk-In Closet(s)
Pantry
Vaulted Ceiling(s)
Soaking Tub

 

Utilities

Underground Utilities

Fireplace Features

Gas Log
 

Window Features

Tilt Out Windows
Vinyl/Aluminum Trim
Insulated Windows

 

Lot Features

1/2 Acre or Less
Few Trees
Sprklr In Grnd-Full Yard
Interior Lot

Style

Traditional
 

Other

Common Area Ins.
Electricity
Pool
Security



Street Lights
Trash
By-Laws
Restrictive Covenants
Water



Description

Welcome home to 7 Cardinal Point, a beautiful custom-built home in the coveted Spinnaker Cove
section of Keowee Key. Spinnaker Cove is a unique community of cottage-style homes like no
other on Lake Keowee. The WOW factor of this home begins as you step up to the welcoming front
porch. Stepping into the home, you will love the modern, open floor plan. The main level begins
with 8’ doors and site-finished hardwood floors throughout the home, upstairs and downstairs. The
doorways are 36” wide. A wide foyer transitions to a vaulted-ceiling great room, kitchen and dining
area. This fabulous entertaining space includes beautiful cabinetry, luxurious stainless steel
appliances, gas range with vented hood and separate microwave drawer and plenty of storage for
the home chef. The shiplap fireplace is a great focal point with additional storage cabinetry on
either side. You will love relaxing or entertaining in this space! The oversized sliding glass doors
open to a generously sized covered porch with composite decking. It is so easy to continue
entertaining with the additional hardscape patio that wraps around to the back of the home. The
primary suite will feel like a relaxing retreat with coffered ceiling and abundant light from the
windows. The primary bath includes a separate shower, large soaking tub, separate water closet
and his and hers sinks. The closet is also generously sized. Downstairs also includes a guest room
and home office. The additional full bathroom includes a beautiful tiled walk-in shower. Walking
upstairs are two additional generously sized bedrooms with plenty of storage. Be sure to check out
the seasonal views of Lake Keowee from the large picture window! The Jack and Jill bathroom is
the perfect set up upstairs. Summer on Lake Keowee is SO CLOSE! Keowee Key is an amenity
rich lake community including 18-hole Championship Golf, Fitness Center, Tennis and Pickle Ball
Complex, walking trails, Fine Dining, Lake Access, Two Marinas, Private Swim Beach, 2 Outdoor
pools and 1 Indoor pool and much more. Only two hours from Atlanta, one hour from Greenville,
and one and a half hours from Asheville. Owner is agent.



SEE THIS PROPERTY

James Schiller

Realtor, Brand Name Real Estate

Phone: 18434788061

Email: jameseschiller@gmail.com

Check On Site

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/7-cardinal-point/salem/sc/29676/MLS_ID_1554579

Location



7 Cardinal Point, Salem, 29676, SC


