
454 Lesesne Street, Charleston, 29492,
SC

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/454-lesesne-street/charleston/sc/29492/MLS_ID_24029454

Price - $3,250,000

Bedrooms

6

 

Baths

4

 

Half Baths

1

 

SqFt

4092

 

Lot Size

0.2300

 

Year Built

2015

 

DOM

203 Days

Features

Exterior

Lawn Irrigation
Lighting

 

Heating

Electric
Heat Pump

 

Floors

Ceramic Tile
Wood

Roof

Metal
 

Community Features

Boat Ramp
Clubhouse



Club Membership
Available
Dog Park
Fitness Center
Golf Course
Golf Membership
Available
Marina
Pool
RV/Boat Storage
Tennis Court(s)
Trash
Walk/Jog Trails

 

Interior Features

Ceiling - Smooth
High Ceilings
Kitchen Island
Walk-In Closet(s)
Ceiling Fan(s)
Bonus
Eat-in Kitchen
Family
Entrance Foyer
Frog Attached
Frog Detached
Office
Pantry
Separate Dining
Study

 

Utilities

Charleston Water
Service
Dominion Energy

Fireplace Features

Gas Log
Great Room
One

 

Window Features

Window Treatments
 

Lot Features

0 - .5 Acre

Style

Traditional
 

Laundry Features

Laundry Room
 

Other

Ceiling Fan(s)
Multiple Closets
Walk-In Closet(s)



Description

This stunning custom built home on Daniel Island is one of only a few homes available with a FULL
GOLF MEMBERSHIP attached to the home. Skip the multiple year waitlist and start playing golf on
Daniel Island's two private golf courses the moment you close on your new home! This home offers
a perfect blend of elegance and comfort and features multiple outdoor living areas, garage space
for 3 cars, master bedroom on the main floor, a study on the main floor and a FROG with a
kitchenette, full bathroom and two closets. As you approach this corner lot home you're greeted by
a charming covered front porch and expansive wraparound porch where you can enjoy a glass of
wine or a cup of coffee and a cool breeze. Step inside to discover ten-foot ceilings and an open
concept design thatenhances the sense of space. Hardwood floors grace the entire home, adding
warmth and sophistication. The kitchen is a chef's delight with breakfast bar seating, ample counter
space, plenty of cabinetry for storage, and an eat-in area. It also includes a walk-in pantry and a
butler's pantry leading to the formal dining room. The owner's retreat is a true haven, boasting a
tray ceiling, his and hers walk-in closets, an en-suite bath with dual vanities, and a walk-in shower.
A soaking tub could easily be added next to the shower. Upstairs are 3 bedrooms, all with walk-in
closets, and a large media room/flex space that could also be used as a bedroom if needed. The
fenced in backyard features a patio and firepit and a 22x11 Cottage that is currently being used as
a golf cart garage. The Cottage could easily be converted into a man cave, art studio, workout
studio, or pool house with outdoor entertainment space - if a pool is desired. Daniel Island Park
amenities include 2 private golf courses, 2 resort style pools, 16 tennis courts, (including grass
court), PickleBall Courts, and state of the art fitness center. Community amenities include miles of
walking/biking trails, multiple playgrounds, community boat dock, shops, restaurants and the Credit
One Stadium - a great venue for concerts and sporting events. Don't miss out on this incredible
home in a beautiful community. Schedule your showing today!



SEE THIS PROPERTY

James Schiller

Realtor, Brand Name Real Estate

Phone: 18434788061

Email: jameseschiller@gmail.com

Check On Site

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/454-lesesne-street/charleston/sc/29492/MLS_ID_24029454

Location



454 Lesesne Street, Charleston, 29492, SC


