
321 Bounty Lane, Charleston, 29412,
SC

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/321-bounty-lane/charleston/sc/29412/MLS_ID_25012842

Price - $899,900

Bedrooms

4

 

Baths

2

 

Half Baths

1

 

SqFt

2541

 

Lot Size

0.2500

 

Year Built

2003

 

DOM

77 Days

Features

Exterior

Balcony
Rain Gutters

 

Cooling

Central Air
 

Floors

Carpet
Ceramic Tile
Wood

Roof

Architectural
 

Laundry Features

Washer Hookup



Laundry Room
 

Interior Features

Ceiling - Smooth
Tray Ceiling(s)
High Ceilings
Kitchen Island
Walk-In Closet(s)
Ceiling Fan(s)
Eat-in Kitchen
Formal Living
Entrance Foyer
Separate Dining

 

Fireplace Features

Family Room
Gas Connection
One

Lot Features

0 - .5 Acre
 

Style

Charleston Single
 

Other

Central
Ceiling Fan(s)
Multiple Closets
Walk-In Closet(s)



Description

***Ask about the possibility of receiving 1% reduction in interest rate and free refi.***Located on a
picturesque corner lot in the heart of James Island, this stunning Charleston single-style home
combines timeless charm with modern luxury in one of the area's most desirable locations. From
the moment you arrive, the lush landscaping and mature trees, including a fruit-bearing grapefruit
tree, create an inviting, serene setting. Inside, tall ceilings, crown molding, wainscoting, and
gleaming wood floors provide a sense of elegance and warmth throughout the home. Just off the
foyer, a graceful pillared entryway opens into the formal living room, flooded with natural light.Flow
seamlessly into the formal dining room and onward to a bright and spacious kitchen featuring
granite countertops, ample white cabinetry, stainless steel appliances, a large peninsula with
seating, and a delightful eat-in area framed by a bay window. The open-concept family room offers
a welcoming space with a cozy gas fireplace and access to the backyard and deck, perfect for
entertaining or relaxing outdoors. A laundry room and a powder room are also conveniently located
on the main floor. Upstairs, the generously sized primary suite impresses with a tray ceiling, two
walk-in closets, and a luxurious en suite bathroom boasting a dual sink vanity, jetted soaking tub,
and a tiled step-in shower. Three additional bedrooms provide plenty of space for family or guests,
with two offering access to the charming second-floor porch. A full bathroom completes the upper
level. Outside, the backyard features a deck and a detached two-car garage with the potential to
finish off the room above. Located just over half a mile from the Harbor View Shopping Center, 3.1
miles from Melton Peter Demetre Park, 4.1 miles from downtown Charleston, and only 9 miles from
the shores of Folly Beach, this home offers the ideal blend of comfort, style, and convenience. This
is a rare opportunity you won't want to miss.



SEE THIS PROPERTY

James Schiller

Realtor, Brand Name Real Estate

Phone: 18434788061

Email: jameseschiller@gmail.com

Check On Site

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/321-bounty-lane/charleston/sc/29412/MLS_ID_25012842

Location



321 Bounty Lane, Charleston, 29412, SC


