
2757 Jobee Drive, Charleston, 29414,
SC

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/2757-jobee-drive/charleston/sc/29414/MLS_ID_25002470

Price - $299,999

Bedrooms

3

 

Baths

2

 

SqFt

1370

 

Year Built

1983

 

DOM

110 Days

Features

Cooling

Central Air
 

Heating

Heat Pump
 

Floors

Ceramic Tile
Luxury Vinyl

Laundry Features

Electric Dryer Hookup
Washer Hookup



Laundry Room
 

Community Features

Dock Facilities
Lawn Maint Incl
Pool
RV/Boat Storage
Tennis Court(s)
Walk/Jog Trails

 

Interior Features

Living/Dining Combo

Utilities

Charleston Water
Service
Dominion Energy

 

Fireplace Features

Living Room
One

 

Lot Features

Wooded

Other

Asphalt
Ceiling Fan(s)



Description

Charming 3-Bedroom End Unit in Ashleytowne Village! Deepwater Dock and Boat Ramp
Access!Discover this beautifully maintained 3-bedroom, 2-bathroom end unit in the highly sought-
after Ashleytowne Village neighborhood. Offering a perfect blend of comfort, style, and
convenience, this two-story home boasts a spacious layout with stunning engineered hardwood
flooring throughout both levels.The inviting interior features a well-appointed kitchen with sleek
Corian countertops, a gorgeous subway tile backsplash, and ample cabinetry. The open-concept
design flows seamlessly into the dining and living areas, perfect for entertaining or everyday
living.The primary suite is a true retreat, complete with a private deck just outside the bedroom,
perfect for relaxing and enjoying the surrounding natural beauty. The en-suite bath is equally
impressive with a walk-in shower and modern finishes. Two additional spacious bedrooms and
another well-maintained bathroom provide plenty of space for family or guests. Outside, you'll find
ample outdoor space, including a screened-in porch that offers a peaceful spot to unwind. The
home is situated in a quiet corner of the neighborhood, providing both privacy and tranquility.
Ashleytowne Village is a fantastic community offering an array of amenities, including private deep-
water dock access, a pool, tennis courts, and boat/RV storage. The neighborhood is beautifully
landscaped with mature trees, serene ponds, and winding paths, perfect for enjoying the outdoors.
With its meticulously maintained features, ample outdoor spaces, and desirable location, this home
is ideal for those seeking both comfort and convenience. Schedule your private showing today to
experience all that this exceptional property has to offer!



SEE THIS PROPERTY

James Schiller

Realtor, Brand Name Real Estate

Phone: 18434788061

Email: jameseschiller@gmail.com

Check On Site

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/2757-jobee-drive/charleston/sc/29414/MLS_ID_25002470

Location



2757 Jobee Drive, Charleston, 29414, SC


