
1661 Indy Drive, North Charleston,
29405, SC

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/1661-indy-drive/north-
charleston/sc/29405/MLS_ID_25012848

Price - $515,000

Bedrooms

3

 

Baths

2

 

Half Baths

1

 

SqFt

1862

 

Lot Size

0.0400

 

Year Built

2018

 

DOM

75 Days

Features

Exterior

Rain Gutters
 

Cooling

Central Air
 

Heating

Natural Gas

Floors

Carpet
Ceramic Tile



Luxury Vinyl
Wood

 

Roof

Architectural
 

Laundry Features

Electric Dryer Hookup
Washer Hookup
Laundry Room

Community Features

Club Membership
Available
Dog Park
Fitness Center
Park
Pool
Trash
Walk/Jog Trails

 

Interior Features

Ceiling - Smooth
High Ceilings
Kitchen Island
Walk-In Closet(s)
Ceiling Fan(s)
Eat-in Kitchen
Formal Living
Entrance Foyer
Living/Dining Combo
Office
Other
Pantry
Separate Dining

 

Utilities

Charleston Water
Service
Dominion Energy

Window Features

ENERGY STAR
Qualified Windows

 

Lot Features

0 - .5 Acre
Level

 

Style

Charleston Single

Other

Ceiling Fan(s)
Split
Walk-In Closet(s)



Description

Stunning Home with Stylish upgrades and open concept living! This beautifully designed home
offers 3 spacious bedrooms, 2.5 bathrooms, and a large open-concept kitchen. Just a few of the
standout features include: Vinyl Plank hardwood flooring, 10-foot ceilings with 8-foot doors on the
first floor, Upgraded front elevation with craftsman accents, Crown molding throughout the first
floor, Quartz countertops and 42'' upgraded cabinetry, Stainless steel gas appliances, Oversized
kitchen island with built-in sink. This home is sure to impress! As you step inside, you'll immediately
appreciate the high ceilings, elegant trim work, and thoughtful layout A versatile flex room at the
entry can serve as a home office, formal dining room, or media room. The spacious family and
breakfast areasflow seamlessly into the kitchen, making this home ideal for hosting guests or
relaxing with friends and family. The kitchen is a chef's dream, featuring gorgeous quartz
countertops, stainless steel appliances, and a large island with seating, plus a walk-in pantry that
provides abundant storage. Off the back entry, you'll find it has its own concrete parking pad for
easy parking right at your back door leading to the a functional mudroom great for keeping shoes,
bags, and jackets organized. Upstairs, the owner's suite offers a peaceful retreat with a split layout,
walk-in closet, and a luxurious bathroom with dual vanities, water closet, linen closet and a walk-in
shower with tile surround. Also upstairs are two additional bedrooms, a full bathroom, large closet
with shelving and a laundry room for added convenience. With thoughtful upgrades throughout,
Let's see what the Community has to offer: Live in a vibrant, amenity-rich neighborhood where you
can join a spontaneous yoga class at the social club, relax by the saltwater pool with poolside
service from Mixson Grill, or grab a coffee from Mixson Market before heading out. Walk your pups
to the dog park, exercise in the common green spaces or take the kids out to play. The location is
unbeatable just minutes from Park Circle's dining and shops, 12 minutes to downtown Charleston,
MUSC, Tanger Outlets and the Charleston International Airport, and about 25 minutes to area
beaches.



SEE THIS PROPERTY

James Schiller

Realtor, Brand Name Real Estate

Phone: 18434788061

Email: jameseschiller@gmail.com

Check On Site

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/1661-indy-drive/north-
charleston/sc/29405/MLS_ID_25012848

Location



1661 Indy Drive, North Charleston, 29405, SC


