
1429 Burningtree Road, Charleston,
29412, SC

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/1429-burningtree-
road/charleston/sc/29412/MLS_ID_25004571

Price - $5,895,000

Bedrooms

4

 

Baths

3

 

Half Baths

2

 

SqFt

6672

 

Lot Size

0.5100

 

Year Built

2001

 

DOM

10 Days

Features

Exterior

Elevator Shaft
 

Cooling

Central Air
 

Floors

Ceramic Tile
Wood

Laundry Features

Washer Hookup



Laundry Room
 

Security Features

Security System
 

Pool Features

Pool - Elevated
Interior Features

Ceiling -
Cathedral/Vaulted
Ceiling - Smooth
High Ceilings
Kitchen Island
Walk-In Closet(s)
Wet Bar
Central Vacuum
Eat-in Kitchen
Family
Formal Living
Entrance Foyer
Game
Office
Pantry
Separate Dining
Study
Sun
Utility

 

Utilities

Charleston Water
Service
Dominion Energy

 

Fireplace Features

Bedroom
Den
Family Room
Two

Window Features

Skylight(s)
 

Lot Features

On Golf Course
 

Style

Traditional

Other

Asphalt
Ceiling Fan(s)
Garden Tub/Shower
Multiple Closets
Outside Access
Sitting Room
Walk-In Closet(s)



Description

Nestled in the coveted Country Club II neighborhood, this exquisite 6,700-square-foot home
commands a private corner lot on the renowned Country Club of Charleston. Meticulously
constructed, the elevated residence boasts a 9-car garage on the ground level and two floors of
luxurious living space above. Surrounded by stunning oak trees, the property features an elevated
saltwater pool and wide porches, blending modern amenities with timeless charm.Step inside the
grand foyer, where natural light floods the entire first floor. Adjacent to the foyer, you'll find a newly
renovated executive office with a wet bar and an elegant formal dining area. Beyond the foyer lies
a cozy sitting area with a gas fireplace and built-in bookshelves. The heart of the home is the
gourmet kitchen,perfect for casual family meals or hosting dinner parties with friends. Highlights
include a large central island with a 6-burner Viking gas range and separate prep sink, a new
double Sub-Zero refrigerator, a built-in oven with warming drawers, and a bar area with a separate
ice maker and dishwasher. Off the kitchen, a spacious family room with vaulted ceilings and floor-
to-ceiling windows adjoins a spacious breakfast nook. Downstairs also features a large laundry
room that doubles as a workout area with ample storage. The main floor primary suite, nearly 500
square feet, is a private oasis with a separate sitting area, gas fireplace, and large windows. Dual
walk-in closets lead to the primary bath, featuring a jetted soaking tub, steam shower, and separate
vanities. Upstairs, you'll find another large family room and game room, along with three
generously sized bedrooms, each with ample closet space and large windows. Two full bathrooms
and a powder room complete the upper level, which also includes a separate laundry room and a
cedar closet. The 3,800-square-foot finished ground floor offers versatile space that can be used as
a home office, gym, or entertainment room, as well as abundant storage to keep your home
organized and clutter-free. Surrounded by lush Japanese maples, hydrangeas, azaleas, fruit trees,
and camellias, the lovely backyard is enveloped by large live oaks, providing a great sense of
privacy. Situated in one of Charleston's most desirable neighborhoods, less than 2 miles from
downtown, this stunning home is close to top-rated schools, parks, shopping centers, and
restaurants. When originally constructed in 2001 the house was truly engineered and built to stand
the test of time. With an insulated concrete form foundation and concrete piers this home is worry
and maintenance free. Don't miss this rare opportunity to make this exceptional property your new
home.
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Location



1429 Burningtree Road, Charleston, 29412, SC


