
134 Country Oaks Lane, Wando,
29492, SC

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/134-country-oaks-lane/wando/sc/29492/MLS_ID_25007911

Price - $725,000

Bedrooms

4

 

Baths

3

 

SqFt

2736

 

Lot Size

0.1600

 

Year Built

2021

 

DOM

28 Days

Features

Exterior

Rain Gutters
 

Cooling

Central Air
 

Heating

Electric
Heat Pump

Floors

Carpet
Luxury Vinyl

 

Roof

Architectural
 

Laundry Features

Electric Dryer Hookup
Washer Hookup



Laundry Room
 

Interior Features

Ceiling - Smooth
High Ceilings
Kitchen Island
Walk-In Closet(s)
Ceiling Fan(s)
Bonus
Entrance Foyer
Living/Dining Combo
Office
Pantry

 

Window Features

Window Treatments

Lot Features

Cul-De-Sac
Level

 

Style

Traditional
 

Other

Asphalt
Central
Ceiling Fan(s)
Multiple Closets



Description

Welcome to Creekside at Beresford, conveniently located less than 2 miles from I-526 and just
minutes from Daniel Island and Mount Pleasant. Prepare to be impressed by this well-appointed
home that is loaded with features and upgrades and flows with abundant natural light. The
welcoming open-concept floor plan is ideal for entertaining, inviting easy conversation between the
kitchen, dining area and living room. The luxurious kitchen features quartz countertops, a tile
backsplash, abundant cabinet storage, a pantry, double ovens, a gas range, a built-in microwave,
and an exterior vented hood. The first floor also features a front office (or alternatively, a sitting
room, playroom etc.), a ground floor bedroom suite with access to a full bathroom with shower, a 2-
car garage, a mudroom and a coat closet. There is attractive LVP flooring throughout the first floor,
providing seamless transitions between rooms. There is easy access to the outdoors from the
kitchen/dining area through a sliding glass door. The sizable rear yard (this is an 0.16 acre lot)
includes an oversized concrete patio (runs the entire length of the house) and a covered grilling
area with a natural gas connection. The wood staircase to the second level features attractive
ornamental railings. The second level features the primary bedroom suite, two additional bedrooms
(each with a spacious closet), a large bonus room, a full hall bathroom (with tub/shower, dual
vanity, and LVP flooring), a laundry room (with convenient built-in cabinets) and a linen closet. The
oversized primary bedroom suite features two walk-in closets, dual vanities, a spacious tiled walk-
in shower (with roman seat/bench and two shower heads), a private water closet, and LVP flooring
in the primary bath. The large bonus room offers many flexible options. It is currently used as an
upstairs den but could also be used as a playroom, office, craft room etc., or even converted into a
5th bedroom. The interior of the 2-car garage has been upgraded with epoxy floors, shelving and a
large workbench with butcherblock top. The curb appeal of this home has been enhanced by a
stone skirt at the front of the house and many upgraded landscaping installations. The exterior also
features front solar motion lights and a motion light in the backyard. There are ceiling fans in all
bedrooms of this home. With an acceptable offer, the seller is willing to convey the wall-mounted
TVs in the bonus room and the master bedroom, all window treatments, all kitchen appliances and
the washer/dryer.
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Location



134 Country Oaks Lane, Wando, 29492, SC


