
11 Tavern, Blythewood, 29016, SC

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/11-tavern/blythewood/sc/29016/MLS_ID_604992

Price - $899,000

Bedrooms

5

 

Baths

3

 

Half Baths

2

 

SqFt

4806

 

Lot Size

0.7900

 

Year Built

1997

 

DOM

16 Days

Features

Cooling

Central
 

Foundation

Crawl Space
 

Style

Traditional

Stories

2
 

Water

Public



Description

Discover the elegance of this stunning all-brick, southern-style estate located in the exclusive gated
Windermere neighborhood in Blythewood. This home sits on Hole 2 of Windermere Country Club's
picturesque golf course. This Todd Gaul designed home boasts 5 bedrooms and 3 full baths and
two half baths, offering ample space for luxurious living. Custom copper Gas Lanterns flank the
entry to the home as you step inside to soaring ceilings and heavy molding adding warmth and
sophistication. The grand staircase creates a breathtaking focal point as you enter the home,
flanked by a formal dining room and library/office with custom mahogany built ins and wet bar. The
open concept Great Room and Kitchen have beautiful views of the backyard oasis. The kitchen has
counter space galore, freshly painted custom cabinets and an eat in space over looking the
picturesque backyard and golf course. The master suite is conveniently situated on the main level
and has a private sauna, massive custom built in closet, marble tile bathroom, separate vanitys and
provides comfort and privacy. The 4 other bedrooms are spacious and located upstairs. Enjoy
outdoor living with saltwater pool, spa, gazebo with stone fireplace and full outdoor kitchen perfect
for relaxing and entertaining. Live the life of luxury with your own exquisite wine cellar. The home
also features NEW HVAC, a two-car garage, and long widened driveway offering plenty of space
for vehicles and storage. The entrance from the garage to the home has a powder room, and is
conveniently located next to the laundry room. This estate-style home combines timeless
architecture with modern amenities, providing a perfect blend of luxury and comfort. Don't miss the
opportunity to own this exquisite home in prestigious Longcreek Windermere! Disclaimer: CMLS
has not reviewed and, therefore, does not endorse vendors who may appear in listings.
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https://searchrealestate.co/properties/11-tavern/blythewood/sc/29016/MLS_ID_604992

Location



11 Tavern, Blythewood, 29016, SC


