
102 Sorrel Oaks, Belton, 29627, SC

https://searchrealestate.co/properties/102-sorrel-oaks/belton/sc/29627/MLS_ID_1552481

Price - $670,000

Bedrooms

4

 

Baths

3

 

Half Baths

1

 

SqFt

5727

 

Lot Size

1.1100

 

Year Built

2015

 

DOM

118 Days

Features

Exterior

Under Ground Irrigation
 

Heating

Floor Furnace
Forced Air

 

Floors

Carpet
Wood
Vinyl

Roof

Architectural
 

Laundry Features

Sink



1st Floor
Electric Dryer Hookup
Washer Hookup
Laundry Room

 

Appliances

Disposal
Free-Standing Gas
Range
Microwave
Gas Water Heater

 

Community Features

Street Lights
Pool

Interior Features

High Ceilings
Ceiling Fan(s)
Ceiling - Smooth
Granite Counters
Tub Garden
Walk-In Closet(s)
Pantry

 

Fireplace Features

Gas Log
 

Lot Features

1 - 2 Acres
Cul-De-Sac

Style

Craftsman
 

Other

Electric
Pool
Recreation Facilities
Street Lights
Restrictive Covenants



Description

Welcome to 102 Sorrel Oaks, a stunning 4,030 sqft home with a 3 car garage and an additional
1,697 sqft walk-out basement—offering endless flexibility, functionality, and future potential.
Nestled on a quiet cul-de-sac on over an acre of land, this property backs up to a wooded area for
unmatched privacy and peaceful views. The main floor features a formal dining room with a
coffered ceiling, a generous living room, and a gourmet kitchen built for entertaining—complete
with an oversized island with bar seating, gas range, pantry, and a cozy keeping room with gas
fireplace. The laundry room offers ample cabinetry and a utility sink, and there's also a hall bath
added convenience. The primary suite on the main level is a true retreat, with a sitting area
overlooking the backyard, a spacious bathroom with dual vanities, separate tub and shower, water
closet, and a massive walk-in closet that can accommodate any wardrobe. Upstairs, you'll find
three bedrooms. Two are connected by a Jack-and-Jill bathroom (each with their own private sink)
and a third bedroom also has a private vanity and access to a full hall bath. The expansive media
room with closets could easily serve as a 5th bedroom, playroom, or home theater. The finished
basement includes a 15'x31' sqft rec room, perfect for a home gym, office, or music room. The
unfinished area of the basement is plumbed for a full bath, has a mini split HVAC installed
throughout, and is ready to be finished to add yet another 1697 sq ft of living space. The outdoor
living for this home is certain to be relaxing and enjoyable with a screened-in porch off the main
floor, a covered patio at the basement level, as well as a sitting area around a fire pit—ideal for
cozy evenings and gatherings with friends. Located in the luxurious and desirable neighborhood of
Hammond Hall, this home blends space, style, storage, and privacy with incredible potential for
growth. Don’t miss your opportunity to own this one-of-a-kind property! All measurements are
approximations using CubiCasa. Any measurements important the the buyer should be verified
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